
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Purchasing Entity: Memphis-Shelby County Schools

Bid ID: IFB 09034VK 

Description: Raleigh Bartlett Elementary An Geeter K-8 Roof

Bids Due By:

Vendor Summary Information

Geeter K-8 Roof

Vendor Base Bid Contingency
Bid 

Allowances

Performance 

Bond
Total 

Carrols Roofing $1,760,127.36 $176,012.74 $0.00 $29,042.10 $1,965,182.20

Ark Roofing Company Inc $1,871,000.00 $187,100.00 $0.00 $25,000.00 $2,083,100.00

B Four Plied, Inc $2,442,973.00 $244,297.30 $0.00 $36,645.00 $2,723,915.30

Medford Roofing Inc $2,700,000.00 $270,000.00 $0.00 $27,000.00 $2,997,000.00

Jessie Bryant Roofing $2,800,000.00 $280,000.00 $0.00 $21,450.00 $3,101,450.00

Vendor Summary Information

Raleigh Bartlett Elementary Roof

Vendor Base Bid Contingency
Bid 

Allowances

Performance 

Bond
Total 

Alternate 

1 

Alternate 

2 

Total 

(Including 

Alternates)

B Four Plied, Inc $1,499,973.00 $149,997.30 $0.00 $22,500.00 $1,672,470.30 $0.00 $0.00 $1,672,470.30

Carrols Roofing $1,558,960.00 $155,896.00 $0.00 $25,722.84 $1,740,578.84 $0.00 $0.00 $1,740,578.84

Jessie Bryant Roofing $1,815,654.00 $181,565.40 $0.00 $14,953.60 $2,012,173.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,012,173.00

Medford Roofing Inc $2,970,000.00 $297,000.00 $0.00 $33,000.00 $3,300,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,300,000.00

Ark Roofing Company Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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